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Compass
School
Manager Free

Compass School Manager App allows
students to upload Online Learning Tasks
and view assessment feedback.

Google
Classrooms Free

Google Classroom is a learning
management system where teachers can
upload student work, assessment,
images, links and video.

Google Meet Free Google Conferencing App

School
Writing
AU/NZ

$8.99

School Writing is a fully-customizable
app that provides students with plenty of
practice to perfect their writing of letters
and numbers using Victorian Modern
Cursive.

Calculator++ Free A calculator

Sight Words:
Kids Learn $1.99 Combines fun, easy to follow activities

with hands-on and audio features to
jumpstart sight word knowledge 1-100.

Scratch Jr Free Students can program their own
interactive stories and games.

Qrafter
Reader Free

Using this app students can scan QR
codes, barcodes and printed URL’s as
well as create their own QR codes.

Interactive
Telling Time Free Interactive Telling Time presents time in a

number of exciting interactive ways.

Number
Frames Free

Number Frames help students structure
numbers to five, ten, twenty, and one
hundred. Students use the frames to
count, represent, compare, and compute
with numbers in a particular range.

Friends of
Ten $1.49

Friends of Ten is an activity to be used in
the early years of schooling to introduce
an early understanding of numbers to ten,
counting objects to ten and recognising a
collection of objects.

I like books $2.99

37 stunning picture books for kids in one
app. Not only are the stories and pictures
fun... they also help your child learn
about the world they live in.



Languagenut Free
Languagenut allows students to learn the
basics of French language in a fun and
developmental way.

A+ Spelling
Test Free Spelling app for P-6

Adobe Spark
Video Free

Provides students opportunities to tell
their own stories through a narrated
presentation.

Adobe Spark
Page Free

Students can create uniquely beautiful
web stories in any content area through
use of photos, youtube videos and text.

Adobe CC
Express Free

Creates beautiful posters for any content
area by bringing words and images
together in fun ways. (Used to be Adobe
Spark Post)

Minecraft
Education
Edition

Free

Educational version of Minecraft that  can
be used in STEM as well as classroom
activities. Requires a school account from
your teacher.

Music
Sparkles Free

Allows students to play xylophone at
home, linking to what happens in Music
classes.

Doodle Buddy
Draw for iPad Free Easy drawing app for iPad

Show Me
Interactive
Whiteboard

Free Whiteboard app for iPad
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